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Course Audio

Course Audio

This eLearning course contains audio.
Please make sure your speakers and headset or earbuds (if applicable) are turned on and working at this time.

Important Note:
Many slides in this course contain additional information in the audio. Please listen to the audio narration or view the closed captioning

by clicking the transcript button located on the bottom of this screen.
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Course Navigation

Course Navigation

-

The buttons you need to navigate the course are located in the top
right corner and along the bottom of the screen. To proceed to the

next slide, click in the lower right corner.
If you need to go back to a slide or navigate directly to a lesson,

click in the top right corner of the screen.
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Additional Information

Additional Information

Throughout this course, you will notice that there are arrow icons like the one pictured on the

right. Please place your mouse over every arrow in this course to read additional infomation
about the image displayed.

Try it now: Please place your mouse over the arrow on the right.
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1-
You will receive additional information in these blue boxes.
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Course Objectives

Course Objectives

At the end of this course, you will be able to:
. Explain Supplier Self-Service Activities
Maintain Company Data
Maintain Own Data (Admin)
Create Contact Persons
Display RFx Documents
Manage RFx Responses
Display and Print Purchase Order
Report on Vendor Spend Data
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Key Terms

MAGIC - Mississippi’s Accountability System for Government Information and Collaboration

The Mississippi State Government’s Enterprise Resource Planning (ERP) solution. Powered by SAP Public Sector® software, MAGIC
replaces the State’s legacy administrative systems with a fully-integrated information system.

Supplier

A vendor of goods or services.

Supplier Administrator

The contact person within a supplier’s company who is responsible for the supplier account
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Key Terms

FEIN - Federal Employer Identification Number (also known as Federal Tax Identification Number)

A unique number assigned to a business which identifies the business as a taxpayer. A FEIN is unique to a business just like a Social
Security Number is unique to a person.

D-U-N-S Number

A unique 9-digit identifier required for all businesses registering with the US Federal government for contracts or grants
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Key Terms

Product Category

Categories of goods and services that your company provides to the State of Mississippi

RFx

Term used to refer to various types of documents used to request responses from suppliers (RFP, ITB, RFQ, RFI, etc.)
RFx Response

A response by the supplier to a request for goods and services from the State of Mississippi when using an RFx document
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Lesson 1: Supplier Self-Service Ove

Lesson 1: Supplier Self-Service Overview

This lesson will explain:

Supplier Registration

Supplier Self-Service Benefits
Supplier Self-Service Portal Logon
Maintaining Company Data
Upload W-9 Form

Find User

Additional User Creation
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Supplier Registration

(\@E i@?g:ﬁmm.mmrs.‘.tate‘:;s _ P2 ET B Google | i S s o3

-

MISSISSIPP MANAGEMENT A

& REPORTING SYSTEM ; : _

HOME | APPLICATIONS | SECURITY | MAGIC | INITIATIVES | TRAINING | CUSTOMER SUPPORT | SOFTWARE DOWNLOADS | QUICK

Mississippi Management and Reporting System

Supplier Registration

New suppliers must register with the SoMS.
e The online registration link is located on the Mississippi Management & Reporting System website
. Once registered, suppliers are provided Self-Service Portal access

http://www.mmrs.state.ms.us
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http://www.mmrs.state.ms.us - NP ://WwWw.mmrs.state.ms.us
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Benefits of Supplier Self-Service

Benefits of Supplier Self-Service

Registered Suppliers have access to the Supplier Self-Service Portal and are added to
the SoMS Supplier List in order to:

e  Respond to SOMS RFx invitations
e  Review Purchase Orders issued to your company

. Receive notifications of engagements, such as Bid Awards, Purchase Orders,
etc.

. Upload W-9s to your supplier record

NOTE: You must submit a W-9 after registering before you may be awarded a
purchasing agreement
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Supplier Notifications

: Supplier
Supplieris Supplier participatesin
Registered Uploads procurement
s processes

Supplier Notifications

Registered suppliers receive e-mail notifications for various procurement activities:
e  RFx Invitations based on Product Category
e  New or updated Purchase Orders
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Supplier Login
[ Having password problems? Please
LI.{;[( = dick on this link for help...

"sss:, Acopuntabity Sysem b Govemmest frmtion and Collaboraion

User
MAGIC is the Mississippi Accountability System @ Password *
for Government Information and Collaboration
initiative,

If you need access or additional information,
please go to the hitpyims.govimagic website.

Supplier Login

Go to the Supplier Self-Service Portal to log on to MAGIC.
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1-
Enter your User name and Password. Click Log On.

2 -

Click the Log On button to continue.
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Supplier Self-Service Portal

L) T SR -
\ [ :—\i I I_: Mississippi Accountability System for Governmen!lnfi New Session SAP Store ‘ Log off

History View Help Welcome: Timothy Caravia

= " ! = | 2 =
Home Procurement Suppliers Self-Service e-Grants General Applications

Supplier Self-Service Work Center Administration

Supplie If-Service = Administration > Company Data
Qwn Data
S — Display Company Data
- B0 -]

Company Data

| + Company Details

Company Details
Name of the Company: *

Other Name:

DUNS Number:

Supplier Self-Service Portal

After you log on you are taken to the Supplier Self-Service Home Page.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Log on to the Portal
In this exercise you will:

e Log on to the Supplier Self-Service Web Portal

To complete this exercise, please click this link.
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click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/a8202484df8349938d992d6b9dda3d39 e
n-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
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Knowledge Check

Knowledge Check

Directions: Select the best answer to the question, and click Continue to submit your answer.

What must the supplier submit before they can submit a bid?

B
®

=
2
B

@ W-9
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Maintain Company Data

Maintain Company Data

Keeping your supplier record current is essential for doing business with the SoMS.
e Avoid documents being sent to an incorrect e-mail address
. All changes will be reviewed and approved by the State of Mississippi
If changes are rejected, the Supplier Administrator will receive an e-mail

notification and the supplier record will revert back to how it was before the
changes were submitted
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Maintain Company Data

TV e S -
[ H l I_: Mississippi Accountability System for Governmen!lmi New Session SAP Store ‘ Log off

History View Help Welcome: Timothy Caravia

= E M =

Home Procurement Suppliers Self-Service e-Grants General Applications

Supplier Self-Service Work Center e Administration

Suppliers Self-S

> Administration > Company Data Full Screen

« Own Data

+ Create Users Di5p'ay company Data
+ Find User @e-

. ~ Company Details

Company Details
Name of the Company: *
Other Name:

DUNS Number:

Maintain Company Data

From the Supplier Self-Service home page, you can maintain your supplier information record.
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1-
Then, select Company Data from the Navigation Menu.

2 -

First, go to the Administration tab.

3-

Click Process to start making changes to your Company Data.

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 24/131



Course LOGB820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

Maintain Company Data

Maintain Company Data

The supplier record has multiple sections.

The first section, Company Details, enables you to maintain your company name and
address, FEIN and/or D-U-N-S Number, and vendor type.

e D-U-N-S Number will help identify supplier locations (optional)
e  Use your company’s main address (the same one used on the W-9 form)
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Company Details

Company Details

Winority Prior End Date:

Name of the Company: * |Snulhern Company, INC
Other Name: |I'-|3'nsippi Power and Light |
DUNS Number: [ Address Data
Vendor's Headguarter State: oo |_|ohn Smith | County: [ IU|
zer::?nr;siiaﬁedt:lﬁce n WS :: Location: [ | company ZIP Code: [29242
redit Card Acceptance: -
Business Structure: CCORP E::ﬂtﬁf' N ::;ﬂlﬂburg :ﬂ. z::?de: .:12:42 ||j|
Vendor Type: = PO Box: [1872 | PO BoxZip Code: 38242
S!a!.e Hi.gnway D$m o I— PO Box Country: |US | PO Box Location:
Legislative/Congressional District: li PO Box Without Number: [
CCR/ CAGE: I - Street Prefoc: [ |
Winorky Indicator: Street: 888 College Drive =]
Minority Status Begin Date; Sireet Suffoc | |
Minority Status End Date: House Number: [ | Buiking Code:
Winorky Prior Begin Date: Floor: [ | Room Number:
| |

Jurigdiction Code::
Minority Code:

Q

Company Details

You can update any of the information in a white field.
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Supplier Ordering Address Change

Supplier Ordering Address Change

The Supplier Ordering Address Submission/ Change Form is used for requesting a change for alternate ordering addresses.
e Use when you have a main office address and alternate addresses for receiving purchase orders
. This form is specifically for the alternative address(es)
e The form cannot be used for changing the W-9 address
e  E-mail the completed forms to: OFMMagic@dfa.ms.gov
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OFMMagic@dfa.ms.gov - mailto:OFMMagic(@dfa.ms.gov
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Ordering Address Data

= Departrment of Finance and Administration
Orderlng Address Data PO BOX 1060 (39215-1080)
501 Morth West Street - Suite 701E
Jackson, M3 35201
B01-359-53538
OFMMagicidfa.ms.gov

Supplier Ordering Address Mzintenance Action
. . Submission/Change Form RIS A Tmazp[] Feme]
This form is only used to create, change or delete MAGIC Main Supplie Data TREEE e A TR (] 0]
alternative order address data. All other changes can be [Supplier Name™

maintained from the Supplier Self-Service Portal.

Supplier Number ¥:

Duns Fumber:

Orderimg Address Information (New)

Supplier Name * ity ™ State®:
Streat’PO Box™: ZIF Cade®: Country™:
Ordermg Address Information (Remove)
Supplier Name®: City™: | Stafe®:
Street’PO Box*: | ZIZP\_,ade":l | Conntry®: |
Submitter’s Contact Information

Hame *: Thons Fumber®:
Emai] Address®: Fax Number:
DFATUse Only
FRecetvaed By: Complated

By:
Heceived Datz Complated

Diate:
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Communication Data

+ Telephone numbers

Add Lines
*Standard *Telephone Number Extension *Country I:I
(s 808-808-8088 us
404-555-1239 us
m]

* Fax Numbers

Add Lines || Delete

*Standard *Fax Number Extension “Country

+ E-mail Addresses

Add Lines

*Standard *E-Mail Address o

(= southern@usm.com

Communication Data

Update Contact information for your company in this section.
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- Tax

B 'Tax Type Description *Tax Number
usz2 usz2 99-0958686

Tax Data

In this section, please enter either the company FEIN Number or Social Security Number (SSN).
. FEIN: use tax type US2
. SSN: use tax type US1

A new W-9 must be attached for any changes made to this information.
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Upload W-9 Form

Add Attachment

File: [ |[ Browse...

o File Name ) [

W3 Relevant Attachment: [

w Attachment

Q Add Aftachment

Wo-Relevant Date File Name

n 0211812013 fest =] [Cancel

Upload W-9 Form

Any document relevant to your company can be attached to the supplier record.
. The W-9 (in pdf) must be attached to the record
. W-9 Relevant Attachment checkbox must be selected
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1-
Click Add Attachment to upload the company W-9 form

2 -

In the Add Attachment dialog box, Browse for the for the file to upload. Then, check W-9
Relevant Attachment.

3.

Click Add.

4-

Use the File Name that downloads or rename accordingly.
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Product Category

w Product Categories

Select the Product Categories that you want to be notified by clicking the "Add Categories Button”
This table contains list of product categories
Q Add Categories @ Delete Categories |

Category ID Category Description &
01921 Crops & Grain Berry

01924 Crops & Grain Buckwheat

01930 Crops & Grain Corn

01932 Crops & Grain Cotton

01956 Crops & Grain Nuts, Tree

Product Category

Supplier records are identified by product categories that represent the goods and services provided by the supplier.
. Categories support the bidding process and drive placement on the Supplier List
. Bid Invitations are sent to suppliers according to the Categories selected
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1-
Click Add Categories button to add new categories to the list.

2-

To remove product categories, select the categories that you want to delete and click Delete
Categories button.
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Add New Product Category

Add Categories

Note: Placeholder search with * is possible. Search ignores upperfiowercase spelling.

Category ID: |
Category Description: @ *art obj*

Haxinum No.of i

[ start Search | | [Reset |

Note: Placeholder search with * is possible. Search ignores upperflowercase speling.
Select Categories from b Category I: [ |

Category Descriplion: |'a|‘l obj* |
Category D Maximum No. of hits: [s00 |
[3] The table does not ct | Start Search | | | Reset |

| Add Selected Categories | Select Categories from below list

Category ID Category Description Select a
- 05200 Art Objects L[] |]
= 05202 Art Objects, Antiques O
= 05208 Art Objects, Ceramic & Glass Objects (Shadow Boxes, etc) O
= - 05232 Art Objects, Fabric Designs. (Sik Screen, efc.) O n

| Add Selected Categories |

Add New Product Category

To add new product categories to your supplier record, use the key word search to find the best options.
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1-
To search for categories use Category Description. You can use an * (asterisk) for wild card

searches. It can be used before and/or after the word to broaden your search options.
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Additional Data

+ Additional data

Copy 5US Document Number - Vendor Document Number: [
Notification of Incoming Documents per E-Mail | |v'°
Tax on Sales/Purchases Code: No E-ail Notification

E-Mail Motification for New Orders

E-Mail Motification for New and Changed Orders
E-Mail Motification for All Documents W

Wendor Currency:

Additional Data

You can specify your notification preferences in the Additional data section.
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1-
Use the drop down list to see the options for notification preference.
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Complete Company Data Maintenance

Display Company Data

| Save || Undo || Cancel |

Complete Company Data Maintenance

You must save your changes before they are submitted to the State for review.
The State reviews and either approves or rejects the changes.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Maintain Company Data
In this exercise you will:
e  Change Company Information

To complete this exercise, please click this link.
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click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/634a0212533e4ectbfe3f4b8cd30al193 en-
US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 42/131


http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/634a0212533e4ecfbfe3f4b8cd30a193_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/634a0212533e4ecfbfe3f4b8cd30a193_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm

Course LOGB820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

Knowledge Check

Knowledge Check

Directions: Select the best answer to the question, and click Continue to submit your answer.

When do you use the Supplier Ordering Address Submission / Change Form?

When you have a main office address and alternate
addresses for receiving purchase orders

Q When changing the W-9 address

@ When changing your physical mailing address g
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Knowledge Check

Knowledge Check

Directions: Select the best answer to the question, and click Continue to submit your answer.

A change to the FEIN or SSN requires a new W-9.

®m
False

2
5
B
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Maintain Own Data

YL/ | S -
[T H l ]jl Mississippi Accountability System for Governmen!lmi New Session SAP Store ‘ Log off

History View Help Welcome: Timothy Caravia

= E e = =

Home Procurement Suppliers Self-Service e-Grants General Applications

Supplier Self-Service Work Center e Administration

> Administration > Own Data Full Screen

4

< Crosis Usars SAP SRM Home | Find | Hel | FAQ | Logoff
+ Find User .‘ Own Data

« Company Dsta | User:TC06

e Process

I General User Information

1

| User Name TCos

Maintain Own Data

Along with Company Data, personal contact information can be maintained in the Own Data section.
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1-
Then, choose Own Data on the menu tree.

2 -

First, go to the Administration tab.

3-

Click Process to make changes to your own data.
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Maintain Own Data

Maintain Own Data SAP SRM  Home | nd | Hep | FAQ | Logolf

|.‘ Own Data > Edi User

€D User : VND000000401
Save

I General User Information

The information in this section is person specific. | User Hame FRE

| *FormDfaddr | Select ||

| *First Name [BONNER ANALYTICAL TESTING CO
o | *Last Hame [ BONNER ANALYTICAL TESTING CO
| "E-mail Address

| company | BONNER ANALYTICALI3100000004
Roles
E. Role Description

[ RISUSBOODO  SUS - Bidder Supplier PO

I Contact Information

| Telephone  [E665554444
| Fax [
| Position |
| cepartment |

I Settings

| Date Format MDD Yy :
| Cecimal Format 12,345.687.90 :

| Time Zone | Central Time (Dalias) =
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1-
User Name is system generated and cannot be changed.

2 -

You can make changes to the General User Information such as e-mail address. You can also
make changes to your contact information and select your setting preferences such as Date
Format and Decimal Format.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Maintain Own Data
In this exercise you will:
e  Change Own Data

To complete this exercise, please click this link.
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click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/0e7¢99b76¢5547bb80d39609353d736¢ ¢
n-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
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i‘l ;"‘1 H [ |‘: Mississippi Accountability System for Government Information and Collaboration

History View Help

Suppliers Self-Service

Supplier Self-Service Work Cente e Administration

Suppliers Seli-Service = nistration = Find User
= Create Users
e Find User SAP SRM Home | Find | Helo | FAQ | Logoff
» Own Data . 4 Find User
= Company Data I Find User
| First Name |
| Last Name |
| User Name
| E-Mail Address |
| company

Q. Fa)

Find Users

You can find the users that have been created for your company.
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1-
Then, choose Find User on the menu tree.

2 -

First, go to the Administration tab.

3-

Click Find to look for that user.

4-

Enter user First Name, Last Name and/or E-Mail Address, etc.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Find Users
In this exercise you will:
. Find Additional Users

To complete this exercise, please click this link.
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click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/62atbe2ae7¢7405b84381f25f7d0497 en-
US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
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Create Additional Users

Create Additional Users Y . H liﬂ, Mississippi Accountability

History WView Help

Additional users may be added to the record. These users Suppliers Self-Service

L
Supplier Self-Service Work Cer.@ Administration

have access to the following:
. View RFx and Purchase Orders
. Create RFx Responses 1
. Maintain their Own Data Create Users

Suppliers S

Find User
Own Data

Company Data
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1-
Then, select Create Users to create additional users.

2 -

Select Administration to create additional users.
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Create Additional Users

Create Additional Users

security role for the user.

From this screen, you can enter General User Information
such as name and e-mail address. You may also select the

Save

Data Privacy Statement

If the personal data of a vendor has been entered in vendor administration,

the vendor has accepted the data

“ou can maintain a text in transaction SES1 for this. In Customizing, you cal

statement.

I General User Information

QDYES, the user has read the data privacy statement and accepts the term

privacy statement.

*Iser Name WHND211120505

*FormO faddr Select. -

*First Name | |
° *Last Name | |

*E-Mail Address | |

*Country UsA -

Language English -

*Company

Roles

B Role Description

[0 | rISUSEDOOD | SUS-B

HE E B8

idder Supplier PO
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1-
Must click theYES check box at the top of the screen in the privacy statement section.

2 -

Enter General User Information for the new user you are creating. The User Name is system
generated and cannot be changed. All other fields are required, including the Roles.
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Create Additional Users

I Contact Information

Telephone

Position

| |
Fax | |
| |
| |

Department

I Settings

Date Format MDD Y -

Decimal Fermat 12,345,687.90 ~ o
Time Zone Central Time (Dallas) -

[¥] Save Ul Settings

Create Additional Users

You will scroll down the page to view the Contact Information and Settings sections.

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 59/131



Course LOGB820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

1-
Complete the Contact Information fields such as telephone and fax. If you want to change

your display settings such as Date Format orTime Zone, make your selections here.
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Create Additional Users

SAP SRM Home | Find | Help | FAQ | Logoff
4 Create User

| Create User
QD [5ave]

Data Privacy Statement

Create Additional Users

You will scroll down the page to view the Contact Information and Settings sections.

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 61/131



Course LOG820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

1-
After entering all the user information, page up to the top of the screen and click Save to create

the user.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Create Additional Users
In this exercise you will:
e Create a New User in the Supplier Self-Service Portal

To complete this exercise, please click this link.
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click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/247d9c4ac6¢84f779b382b614309280¢_en
-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
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Knowledge Check

Knowledge Check

Directions: Select the best answer to the question, and click Continue to submit your answer.

All registered users will have authorization to complete which of the following?

Maintain own data, view and respond to RFxs and purchase
orders

Q Maintain own data and company data, view RFx, submit
RFx responses

@ Maintain company data, view purchase orders and RFxs g
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Lesson 2: RFx

This lesson will explain:
. RFx Process Overview
. RFx Notification
. RFx Document Information
) RFx Response
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RFx Process Overview

. . &
Request for Supplier reviews
— Bid (RFx) from - RFx document and
& . SOMS Buyer | .__decides tobid
IG ¥ ;
2 SOMS Buyer Supplier -
E ‘ reviews all RFx _ creates/submits a
= . Responses ._an RFx Response %
5 O
3 SOMS Buyer ‘ Receives Letter of
[} Awards RFx Intent
ot "
v
SOMS creates _ Acts on Purchase 1
Contract or Order or Contract
Purchase Order \

RFx Process Overview

This process starts with the Buyer creating an RFx and making it available to the supplier. The supplier reviews the RFx and decides
whether or not to participate.
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RFx Notification

RFx Notification

The notification for an RFx invitation is provided to suppliers by one or more of
the following methods:

e  E-mail sent to the Supplier Contact Person

. Newspaper

. Mississippi Public Bid Board Website

L]

Supplier Self-Service Portal for registered suppliers v
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RFx Document Information

Display RFx : 3160000291

RFx Humber 3150000251 Smart Number 1130-14-R-IFBD-00100 RFX Status Published RFx Start Date 0~
RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Wersion RFx Response 000000038
[Close | | [Print Preview | | [Refresh | | [ Do Mot Participate | [ Tentative | [ Questions and Answers (0 ) | [ Export |

RFX Information |’ tems MNotes and Attachments

| RFx Parameters | CQuestions | Mote and Attachments | Conditions | Payment

RFx Document Information

RFx documents provide relevant information:
. RFx Information (i.e. submission date, opening date, buyer contact information)
. Item details (i.e. item description, quantity requested, delivery dates, ship to address)
. Notes and Attachments (i.e. material or service specs, terms and conditions)
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RFx Response

RFx Response

With the RFx Response feature, suppliers are able to:

e  Respond to an RFx electronically through Supplier-self-service or submit a paper response
NOTE: Submit RFx responses prior to the bidder submission deadline date/time

Update the RFx Response electronically at any time (as allowed), up to the bidder submission deadline date/time
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Search & Display an RFx

v v
LA

History Wiew

H I l_]l" Mississippi Accountability System for Government Information and Collaboration

Help

Suppliers Self-Service

@ Supplier Self-Service Work Center  Administration

Suppliers Self-Service = Supplier Self-Service Work Center = RFx and Auctions

Work Center Overview
Supplier Self-Service Work C... Active Queries

e RFx and Auctions eRFxs All(1) Published (1} Ended (0} Completed (1)
Without Category Assignment New Query (1)

Purchase Orders

Search & Display an RFx

MAGIC provides search functionality to enable looking up RFx information.
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1-

Click Supplier Self-Service Work Center.

2 -

Next, click RFx and Auctions to search and display.
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RFx Search Fields

eRFxs AN(D) Pubsshed (D) Ended (0) Completed (0}

[+ Hae Quick Criteria Maintenance

RFx Nummder [ | To &
RFx Status =

My Respenses From B

Smart Number

Agency ¢ o To n) =
Commodity > m) To o &
Buy > ., To - e

_Q »p:g [ Clear
RFx Search Fields

You have many options available to aid in your search:

® RFx Number
o RFx Status

e Agency

o Commodity

e My Response From
e Buyer
o Smart Number
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1-
Enter the search criteria and click Apply.
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RFx Lists

Active Queries

eRFxs MI{1) Published(0) Ended(0) Compleled (0) @

eRFxs - All

| = Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance

RFx Number &= 3160000230 To <
RFx Status Current RFx -
My Responses From Today -
Smart Number
Agency <@ o To - B
Commodity < ) To & &
Buyer < - To m) Lo
Apply | [ Ciear | o
View. [Standard View] __|=] | [ Create Response || | Dispiay Event | Dispiay Response ||| Print Preview | | [ Retresh [ ©xport 4]
E. RFxNumber  Smart Number RFx Type RFxStalus Start Date  Response Number Response Slatus
160000230 | 1130-15-R-IFBD-00035-vD1  Invitation for Bl Published  01/2272015 6000000153 Submitted

RFx Lists

Search queries provide a list of results from which to choose.
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1-
Active Queries are pre-defined searches to help you easily display information.

2 -

This screen displays the RFx from a supplier’s view.
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Supplier Self-Service Work Center Administration

> Suppler Sell-Service Work Center = RFx and Auctions

eRFxs All{15) Published (15} Ended (0) Completed (1}

Without Category Assignment New Query (0)

eRFxs - All

{» Show Quick Criteria Maintenance |

View: (standerd View] _[w] ||| Creote Response | ||| Display Event ]| Display Response ] ||| Print Preview ]|
B. EventNumber RFx Number o Event Type Event Status StartDate End Date  Response Number °spnnse Status
3160000434 1130-14-R-FBD-00131 | Invitation for Bid = Published 021272014 | 021472014 No Bid Created
3160000493 1130-14-R-FBD-00130 | Invitation for Bid = Published 02122014 | 021472014 He Bid Created
3160000492 1130-14-R-FBD-00129 | Invitation for Bid Published 021272014 | 021472014 No Bid Created
3160000491 1130-14-R-FBD-00128 | Invitation for Bid = Published 021272014 | 021472014 No Bid Created
| 31600004 1130-14-R-FBD-00127 | Invitation for Bid = Published 02M22014 | 021472014 No Bid Created
360000479 1130-14-R-FBD-00126  Invitation for Bid = Published 0222014 021472014 No Bid Created
| 3160000478 1130-14-R-FBD-00125 | Invitation for Bid = Published 02nzz014 | 021472014 No Bid Created
3680000477 1130-14-R-FBD-00124  Invitation for Bid = Published 0222014 021472014 No Bid Created

Respond to an RFx

When you receive an RFx notification you may respond to it via the RFx document found on the RFx list.
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1-
Review the status to see if a bid response has been created.

2 -

Click the RFx number to display for review.
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Choose to Participate

Display RFx : 3160000241

RFx Number 3160000241 Smart Number 1130-14-R-IFBD-00085
Remaining Time 350 Days 04:29.30 RFx Owner Mr. Sims Harman

RFX Status Published
RFx Viersion Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Versio

RFx Start Date 01/07/2014 14:50:00 CST

[Ciose | | [Print Preview | | [Refresh | Panim@a Not Participate | | Create Response | | Questions and Answers (0 ) | [ Export |

— ]

RFX Information l tems ©  MNotes and Attachments

RFx Parameters Questions | MNote and Attachments | Conditions | Payment

Time Zone: CST

Start Date: 010772014 02:50:00 pm
Opening Date; * 12312014 01:30:00 pm
End of Binding Period:

Currency. usb

w Partners and Delvery Information

. | Details || Add 4 || Send E-Mail |[ Call | Clear |
Function Number
» Reguester

Choose to Participate

Bidder Submission Deadline Date: 12/31/2014
Bidder Submission Deadiine Time: 01:30:00 pm

Name

Sims Harman

After you have reviewed the RFx, you may notify the agency of your plan to participate or not.
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1-Click Participate to notify agencies you plan to create an RFx response.
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Create an RFx Response

Display RFx : 3160000241

RFx Number 3160000241 Smart Number 1130-14-R-IFBD-00085 RFX Status Published RFx Start Date 01/07/2014 14:50:00 CST
Remaining Time 350 Days 04:29:30 RFx Owner Mr. Sims Harman RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Versio
| Close | [ Print Preview J | Refresh | | Participate | | Do Not Participate || Create Response ” Questions and Answers (0 ) || Export |
_

Ilfllnfnrmaﬂonl tems | Motes and Attachments

RFx Parameters Questions | Note and Attachments | Conditions | Payment

Time Zone: csT Bidder Submission Deadiine Date 12/31/2014
Start Date: 01007/2014 | [02:50:00 pm Bidder Submission Deadline Time:01:30:00 pm
Opening Date; * 120312014 01:30:00 pm

End of Binding Period:

“w Partners and Delvery information

Details || Add Send E-Ma
Function Number Hame
* Requester Sims Harman
= Location MS DEPT FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION
[Ciose | | [PrintPreview | | [Refresh| | [Participate | [ Do Not Particime Create Response | | Questions and Answers (0 ) | | Export |

Create an RFx Response

You have signified your plan to participate and now you can create the response.
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1-
Click Create Response.
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Create an RFx Response: Buttons

Create RFx Response

RFx Response Humber 6000000030 RFx Number 3160000241 Status In Process Submission Deadline 12/31/2014 13:30:00 C57
Opening Date 12/31/2014 13:30:00 CST Remaining Time 350 Days 04:09:57 RFx Owner Mr. Sims Harman Target Value 12,
RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Humber 1

[ Submit || Close | | [ Read Only | [ Print Preview | | [ Check | [ Save | [ Export | [ import | [ Questions and Answers (0} |

Notes and Attachments | Conditions | Summary |  Tracking

Create an RFx Response: Buttons

If there are questions from purchaser, you can display and respond to them here.

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 83/131



Course LOGB820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

Create an RFx Response: Questions

= o Attribute Doss the vendor accept the required contractusl te is mandatory; maintain attribute value

o Attribute How long has your company been in business (Specif is mandatory; maintsin attribute value

[ Submit | [ Close | | [Resd Only | [ Print Preview | | [ Check || Save | [Export | [ Import | [ Questions and Answers (0] |

RFx Information - Items [  Motes and Attschments | Conditions ©  Summary | Tracking

Basnﬂaaﬂ.lestlrrs | Motes and Attachments | Conditions | Payment

Guestion Reply Comment
How long has your company been in business (Specify in years): * YR
Does the vendor acoept the required contractual terms and conditions: * Yes " No

Create an RFx Response: Questions

If there are questions from purchaser, you can display and respond to them here.
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1-
Use the Questions tab to respond to the buyer’s questions.

2-Error messages are generated when the required questions are not answered.

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 85/131



LOG820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

Course

Create an RFx Response: Notes and Attachments

Edit RFx Response 6000000036

RFx Response Mumber 8000000035 RFx Number 3180000255 Status |n Process
Remaining Time O Days 00:00:00 RFx Owner SUPEREGSZ1 Target Value 0.00 USD

[ Submit | [ Clese | | [[Read Onty |[ Print Preview | | [ Check |[ Save | [ Export |[ Import | [ Questions and Answers (D) |
RFx Information - Items | Motes and Attachments | Conditions ||  Summary [ Tracking

Submission Deadline 01/24/2014 11:14:00 C5T
RFx Response Version Mumber C1

Basic Dats | Questions | Notes and Attachments | Conditions | Payment

w Motes
Category Description
Q Conditions of Participation -Empty-
RPFx/Auction Text -Empty-
-Empty-
Justification -Empty-

w Attachments

| Add Attachment || Edit Description || fersio
Category Desoription
m The table doss not contain any data

Frecessor Checked Out

Create an RFx Response: Notes and Attachments

The Notes and Attachments section allows you to provide additional information to the buyer.

Type
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1-There are several categories of notes. Bidder can add remarks for the buyer.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Create an RFx Response

In this exercise you will:
e  Display an RFx
. Create an RFx Response
. Add Attachment

To complete this exercise, please click this link.
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click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/3d60f5{6b49642659d95464cd0a5e424 en
-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
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Knowledge Check

Knowledge Check

Directions: Select the best answer to the question, and click Continue to submit your answer.

Which of the following is not used to provide RFx invitation to the suppliers?

@ E-mail sent to the Supplier Contact Person

@ Mississippi Public Bid Board Website g

@ Supplier Self-Service Portal for registered suppliers
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Knowledge Check

Knowledge Check

Directions: Select the best answer to the question, and click Continue to submit your answer.

True or False. You must notify SoMS of your plan to participate in the RFx process.

®m
False

2
5
B
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View RFx Response

Active Queries

*RFxs AN(1) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0)
eRFxs - All

| = Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance o

RFx Number 5| 3160000230 o @

RFx Status Current RFx -

My Responses From Today -

Smart Number

Ay e o To o =

Commodity .2 m) To g =

e b o To o =

[Apply | [ Clear |

View |[stancara view] [ ||| Create Response ||| Dispiay Event | rspiay Response ||| Print Preview ] || Refresh | Export <]

EL RFxMNumber  Smart Number RFx Type RFxStalus Start Date_ Response Number Response Status
@ 2160000230 | 1130-15-R-FBD-00035-V01  Invitation for Bid  Published 0122206 6000000153 Submitted

View RFx Response

To view RFx responses you will return to the Supplier Self-Service Work Center > RFx and Auctions screen.

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 92/131



Course LOGB820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

1-To view an RFx click the Event Number.
2-To view a Response click the Response Number.
3-You can search for a specific RFx response or you can view a list.
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View RFx Response Details

Display RFx Response 6000000038

RFx Response Number 5000000038 RFx Humber 3150000251 Status Submitted Submission D¢
RFx Owner NMr. Sims Harman Target Value 0.00 USD RFx Response Version Humber Active Ve
[Close | | [Print Preview | | [Refresh | | [ withdraw | [ Export | [ Questions and Answers (0 ) |

e RFx Information i’ tems | Motes and Attachments © Conditions |  Summary | Tracking

‘ Basic Data | CQuestions | Notes and Attachments | Conditions | Payment

Event Parameters
alidity Period: -
Currency: United States Dollar

Target Value of RFx Responze: 0.00| USD

View RFx Response Details

The RFx Response screen has several tabs to organize the information.

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc

94/131



Course LOG820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

1-
Tabs that organize the information.
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Ask the Buyer a Question

Display RFx : 3160000291

Smart Humber 1130-14-R-IFBD-00100
RFx Version Type Active Wersion

RFx Number 31600002531 RFX Status Published RFx Start Dat
RFx Response S000000035

RFx Version Number 1

| Close | | Print Prewview | | Refresh | | Do Not Participate || Tentat'r'.a Questions and Answers (1) || Export |

Display RFx Response 6000000038

RFx Number 3160000251
Target Value 0.00 USD

| Withdraw | EXD[@ Questions and Answers (0} |

RFx Response Number 5000000032 Status Submitted Submission D¢
RFx Response Version Number Active Ve

RFx Owner Mr. Sims Harman

| Close | | Print Preview | | Refresh |

Ask the Buyer a Question

Questions and Answers can be accessed from the RFx or the RFx Response.

96/131
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1-

Click Questions and Answers.

2 -

Click Questions and Answers.
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Ask the Buyer a Question

Questions and Answers E B

Refresh | [v] Display Time Stamps

Time Stamp Sender Message
Questions and Answers E E
[ Display Time Stamps
Time Stamp Sender Message =
[m | (= 01/15/2014 10:23:49 CST Ms. Golden Eagle |Can substitutions
list.
Send Message
Message: Can substitutions be made to the material
list.

Ask the Buyer a Question

Enter the question in the Message text box. Click the Send button and the time stamp will be updated.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Ask a Buyer a Question
In this exercise you will:
e  Display an RFx
e Ask aBuyer a Question

To complete this exercise, please click this link.
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click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/04724da43aa2430881ef868281cf3526 en
-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
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Knowledge Check

Knowledge Check

Directions: Select the best answer to the question, and click Continue to submit your answer.

True or False. You can only view the questions and answers in the RFx.

®m
False

2
5
B
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Change RFx Response

Display RFx Response 6000000032

RFx Response Number 8000000032 RFx Number 3160000241 Status Submitted Submission Dead|
RFx Owner Mr. Sims Harman Target Value 0.00 USD RFx Response Version Number Active Versic

@ Edt ] [Cose| | [PrintPreview | | [Refresn | | [Winaraw | [Export ] [ Questions and Answers (2) |
=
RFx Information [ kems | Motes and Attachments | Conditions | Summary | Tracking

‘ Basic Data Questions Notes and Attachments Conditions. Payment

Change RFx Response

Click the Edit button to make changes to the RFx Response.
. Changes can be made to price, delivery time, and new attachments can be added.
. All versions of the RFx response can be accessed.

NOTE: Not all RFx Notifications allow for changes to the initial RFx Response.
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1-
Click Edit to make changes to the RFx Response.
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Change RFx Response Details

Edit RFx Response 6000000032

RFx Response Number 5000000032 RFx Humber 3150000241 Status In Process Submission Deadline 1.
RFx Owner Mr. Simz Harman Target Value 0.00 USD RFx Response Version Number C2 RFx Versi
@ submit | [ Close | | [ Read Only | [ Print Preview | | [ Check | [ Save | [ Export | [ Import | [ Questions and Answers (2 ) |

R‘F:hlfnmlaﬁml‘ tems | Motes and Attachments ©  Conditions © Summary | Tracking

Basic Data | Questons | Motes and Attachments | Conditions | Payment

Change RFx Response Details

When you have completed the changes to the RFx Response you must submit it for review by the State.
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1-
After making changes, click Submit to re-submit the RFx response.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Change an RFx Response

In this exercise you will:
e  Display an RFx Response
. Edit an RFx Response

To complete this exercise, please click this link.

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 106/131


http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/911d581da4c046ac838b96ca7e8b3a43_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/911d581da4c046ac838b96ca7e8b3a43_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/911d581da4c046ac838b96ca7e8b3a43_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/911d581da4c046ac838b96ca7e8b3a43_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/911d581da4c046ac838b96ca7e8b3a43_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm

Course LOG820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/911d581dad4c046ac838b96ca7e8b3a43 en
-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
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Sample of RFx Award Letter

Notification for Rfx Response Number 6000000420

Created

State of Mississippi
M5 IFORMATION TECHNOLOGY SERVICES
EASTWOOD DR

JACKSON M5 35211

Date 01/08:2014

BOFAMS. GOV
TEST VENDORZ2
FIRST2 LASTZ
123 STATE ST
JACKSOH M5 35211

RE:GO00000420, | 1601.14-R.PREC.DD0T |

Dheat Frst2 Last2

On behall of the State of Mississippi and the MS IFORMATION TECHNOLOGY SERVICES. | want to thank you for the solicitation response you submitted ke 6000000420, [ 1601.14.R.PREQ-D00T )
The State has completed the review process and has recommanded Test Vendoe? for award. B is important 10 mote that the Intent to Awaed dows not becomae final until the contract is sxscuted
Sheild you hive 3y quesbans, plesse & nol heslate 1o contact me

Sincaraly,

Sample of RFx Award Letter

Should you be selected to provide the product or service you will receive an award letter.
e Letter of intent will be e-mailed to company
e Letter of intent is not final until a contract is executed
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Lesson 3: Purchase Order

This lesson will explain:
. Display Purchase Orders
. Print Purchase Orders
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View Purchase Orders

Suppliers Self-Service
Supplier Self-Service Work Center Administration

Supplier: > SBupplie nter = Work Center Overview

BE Supplier Self-Service Work Center [_-:1- Purchase Orders
[=* The Supplier Self-Service Work Center is the central point for suppliers scoessing all their @ All
il functionality. Use the Supplier Work Center by clicking on the appropriate links. N_

=0

Vendor Spend Application

Changed

In Process

RFx and Auctions o
Lonfirmed
Partislhy Confirnved

Rejected
Canceled by Customer

View Purchase Orders

You can view the purchase order but cannot make any changes.
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1-
Select Purchase Orders to view a list of Purchase Orders.
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View Purchase Orders

Suppliers Self-Service

Supplier Self-Service Work Center Administration

Suppliers Self-Se > Supplier Self-Service Work Center > Purchase Orders > All
Work Center Overview
Supplier Self-Service Work C... SAP SRM Home | Eind | Help | FAQ | Logoff .‘ 2
RFx and Auctions . 4 Listof Purchase Orders
Purchase Orders | List of Purchase Orders
» Services . Print | | Download
Al E. | Document Number % | Document Name % DocumentDate Status Total Value
New
e 6500000071 (Copy of the order 4000000481) 12M172013  Hew 6,000.00 USD
Changed
[N 8500000080 (Copy of the order 4000000479) 12112013 Hews £,000.00 USD
In Process @
Confirmed 6500000070 SH112113 121172013 15:44 121172013 In Process | &.000.00 USD
Partially Confirmed | |~ Page| 1of1 |||

Rejected

Canceled by Customer

View Purchase Orders

All purchase orders for a supplier display as a default. Filter the list by selecting a status.
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1-
Click a Document Number to view the Purchase Order.

2 -

Select a status to filter the results list.
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View Purchase Orders

| Display Purchase Order

[ Set to "In Process” | | Display Document Flow | [ Print | [ Download |

| Purchase Order No.

| Requested Follow-On Documents

I Basic Data
| Document Number £500000071
| Document Name (Copy of the order 4000000481)
| Document Date 121172013

4000000482

Confirmation, Invoice

View Purchase Orders

You can view details of the purchase order. Scroll down to view all of the information.

| Status New
I Item Overview
Humber Status Product Line Type Short Text Order quantity Purchase Order Value
Q 1 New Electric 20 each £,000.00 USD
I Messages
Description Preview | Message from Purchaser
B Message from Purchaser Please ship soon Piease ship soon
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1-
Click a line item in the Item Overview section to view item details.
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View Purchase Orders Line Item Details

Basic Data

Postion  Status Product  Revision Level ProductType Short Text Order quantity Purchase Order Value Required on
1 New Material Electric 20 each 6,000.00 USD 121172013

Enter Delivery Times

Delvery Date Order quantity
No schedule lines exist

Price Information

Condition Price Per Vale
Net Value (Ordered) 300.00 USD 1 each 6,000.00 USD
Messages

Descrigt Preview | Message from Purchaser E]
B Message from Purchaser =
Partner Information

Partner Number Name Street House No. PostCode Location  Telephone E-mail

Sold-to Party 3102111208 SoMS Magic Agency Address 100 39201 Jackson  555-000-0000 egeqeqe@@adadada.com

View Purchase Order Line Item Details

All information on this screen applies only to the line item selected.
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Print or Download Purchase Order

Print or Download Purchase
Order | Display Purchase Order

[Setto “in Process" | | Display Document Fic ) Print

Both Print and Download functions are available.

Opening susdoc.zip ﬁ
You have chosen to open:
1, susdoc.zip

which is & Compressed (zipped) Folder (2.0 KB)
from: https://susdev.magic.ms.gov

What should Firefox do with this file?

Open with [Wiﬂduws Explorer (default) v]

| ©SoveFile 1 |}

l [T] Do this autoratically for files like this from now on,

Q oK | [ Cancel
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1-
You can select Print to print your document or Download to save your Document on your
computer.

2.

With either selection, Print or Download, a prompt displays. Select Open with or Save File and
Click OK.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Print a Purchase Order

In this exercise you will:
e  Display a Purchase Order
. Print a Purchase Order

To complete this exercise, please click this link.

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 119/131


http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/ad23195bc0fd4e2f8144bd22345952b8_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/ad23195bc0fd4e2f8144bd22345952b8_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/ad23195bc0fd4e2f8144bd22345952b8_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/ad23195bc0fd4e2f8144bd22345952b8_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/ad23195bc0fd4e2f8144bd22345952b8_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm

Course LOG820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/ad23195bc0fd4e2{8144bd22345952b8 en
-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
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Knowledge Check

Knowledge Check

Directions: Select the best answer to the question, and click Continue to submit your answer.

Which of the following statuses may be used to display purchase orders?

Confirmed E
New g
A
In Process g
Rejected 0

All of the Above

GECRGCRCRC
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Lesson endor Spend Report

Lesson 4: Vendor Spend Report

This lesson will explain:
e Vendor Spend Report
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Vendor Spend Application

Supplier Self-Service Work Center Administration

Supplers Sel ce > Suppber Self-Service Work Center > Work Center Overview

- - Supplier Self-Service Work Center
Supplier Self-Service Work Center

The Supplier Self-Service Work Center is the central point for suppliers accessing all their
Use the Suppler Work Center by clicking on the appropriate nks.

Vendor Spend Application

Work Center Overview

Supplier Self-Service Work C...

RFx and Auctions

RFx and Auctions

Purchase Orders

- Services

.l’::-ndor Spend Application

Vendor Spend Application

This provides a report of a supplier’s spend period and amount based on the ordering agency name and SoMS contract number.
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1-
Click the Vendor Spend Application link to view report selections.

2 -

In Supplier Self-Service Work Center, select the Vendor Spend Application link to view
report selections.
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Vendor Spend Application

Suppliers Selt-Servi = : (C = Supplier Self-5 ork Center » Vendor Spend Application

Vendor Spend Report

e [ create |[ 27 Change |[[E] save |[ 2 Print | [ 5 Refresh

Instructions: Please complete all relevant fields below

“endor / Supplier ID: * | 3100000501

‘Vendor / Supplier Name: | Office Depot New Te13 ya
QSpend Period From; * il

Vendor Spend Data

Vigw| [Standard View] ~| | [ Append Row || Insert Row || Delete Row | Filter Settings
) State of Product Spend Spend |:|
g?:;w Sgi:rll:mg Agency Missiszippi Smart Number Category ( Period Amount(
P Contract Number NIGP } To usb )
] - 0.00
o 0.00

Vendor Spend Application

Complete the fields to select the Spend Period From date, the Agency Group, Ordering Agency Name, Contract Number, Product
Category, and Spend Amount.
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1-
Select a Spend Period From date.

2 -

Enter Spend Data based on the same Spend Period From date.

3-You can create, change, save, print a report or refresh the screen. Refresh the fields to re-enter
a new Spend Period From date.
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Vendor Spend Application

[ [ create |[ &7 change |[ [2] save | [ 3 Print | [ 5] Refresh

Instructions: Please complete all relevant fields below
“endor / Supplier ID: * | 3100000501

“endor / Supplier Name: | Office Depot New Te13 ya

Spend Period From: *  |[07/082013 [

[ 8] Search | [ cear
Vendor Spend Data
View| [Standard View] ~| | [Append Row |[ Insert Row |[ Delete Row | [ [ Edt | Fitter Settings
Ordering St_ate_ m:— . Product Spend
Mississippi Spend
Agency Group Agency Smart Mumber Category ; Amount
Contract Period To
MName [ NIGP } (USD )
Number
E HL - UNNWERSITY IHL 8200005327 1601-13-C-CNTR-00690 00556 08082013 1,000.00
’_ OTHER GOWERNING AUTHORMY Supreme Court 8200005274 1601-13-C-CNTR-00822 00556 0930/2013 2,000.00
= 3,000.00

Vendor Spend Application

Above is an example of the fields populated.
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Now It's Your Turn - Exercise

Now It's Your Turn!

Create a Vendor Spend Report
In this exercise you will:
e  Create a Vendor Spend Report

To complete this exercise, please click this link.
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click this link -

http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/7422ca4344¢3454da1552600d3ed0fdf en
-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm

Tuesday, January 27, 2015 LOG820 Supplier Self-Service.ulc 129/131


http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/7422ca4344c3454da1552600d3ed0fdf_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm
http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/ucontent/7422ca4344c3454da1552600d3ed0fdf_en-US/sim/html/sim_standard.htm

Course LOGB820 Supplier Self-Service eLearning

Course Summary

Course Summary

This course is complete. You should now be able to:
. Explain Supplier Self-Service Activities

Maintain Company Data

Maintain Own Data (Admin)

Create Contact Persons

Display RFx Documents

Manage RFx Responses

Display and Print Purchase Order

Report on Vendor Spend Data
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Support Information

Support Information
Please go to the MMRS website for the latest Customer Support
information.
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